
March 31, 2015

Item No. Assessment No. Winning Bid

1 006-073-028-000 REDEEMED

2 006-311-009-000 REDEEMED

3 006-312-008-000 113,100.00                           

4 008-143-015-000 REDEEMED

5 008-232-012-000 WITHDRAWN

6 021-281-005-000 REDEEMED

7 031-151-006-000 REDEEMED

8 053-221-003-000 REDEEMED

9 081-021-008-000 REDEEMED

10 105-193-008-000 WITHDRAWN

11 105-193-009-000 WITHDRAWN

12 105-193-010-000 REDEEMED

13 109-041-023-000 NO BID

14 109-051-002-000 NO BID

15 109-061-024-000 NO BID

16 109-071-033-000 NO BID

17 109-081-048-000 NO BID

18 109-101-008-000 NO BID

19 109-101-021-000 4,400.00                                

20 109-101-025-000 4,500.00                                

21 109-101-030-000 NO BID

22 109-121-006-000 2800.00*

23 109-121-018-000 NO BID

24 109-131-013-000 NO BID

25 109-131-048-000 NO BID

26 109-141-022-000 NO BID

27 109-182-018-000 NO BID

28 109-182-019-000 5600.00*

29 109-182-041-000 NO BID

30 109-182-052-000 NO BID

31 109-183-017-000 REDEEMED

32 109-183-018-000 REDEEMED

33 109-191-007-000 NO BID

34 109-191-026-000 17,300.00                             

35 109-192-041-000 2100.00*

36 109-193-015-000 NO BID

37 109-202-049-000 NO BID

38 109-211-017-000 NO BID

39 109-211-033-000 NO BID

40 109-211-036-000 NO BID

41 109-241-004-000 NO BID

42 109-241-005-000 NO BID
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43 109-241-041-000 NO BID

44 109-261-031-000 NO BID

45 109-281-006-000 NO BID

46 109-281-020-000 3500.00*

47 109-292-024-000 8,600.00                                

48 109-311-002-000 NO BID

49 109-311-047-000 NO BID

50 109-331-029-000 2200.00*

51 109-331-031-000 NO BID

52 109-341-017-000 NO BID

53 109-341-022-000 NO BID

54 109-341-034-000 2600.00*

55 109-341-035-000 2500.00*

56 109-362-004-000 17,700.00                             

57 109-362-005-000 NO BID

58 109-362-007-000 26,000.00                             

59 110-021-002-000 NO BID

60 110-021-022-000 NO BID

61 110-021-031-000 NO BID

62 110-021-058-000 4500.00*

63 110-071-002-000 REDEEMED

64 110-071-008-000 NO BID

65 110-081-031-000 NO BID

66 110-091-024-000 NO BID

67 110-121-007-000 NO BID

68 110-131-026-000 NO BID

69 110-141-030-000 NO BID

70 110-151-011-000 NO BID

71 110-151-014-000 NO BID

72 110-181-007-000 NO BID

73 110-181-017-000 NO BID

74 110-191-050-000 5000.00*

75 110-201-019-000 3700.00*

76 110-201-021-000 NO BID

77 110-201-022-000 NO BID

78 110-211-032-000 NO BID

79 110-211-036-000 NO BID

80 110-211-037-000 4,500.00                                

81 110-261-039-000 NO BID

82 110-281-023-000 5,900.00                                

83 110-291-026-000 NO BID

84 110-291-030-000 NO BID

85 110-301-042-000 NO BID

86 111-012-002-000 2900.00*

87 111-031-021-000 3,200.00                                

88 111-051-019-000 NO BID
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89 111-052-050-000 13,000.00                             

90 111-111-058-000 7,800.00                                

91 111-112-006-000 NO BID

92 111-112-013-000 NO BID

93 111-142-001-000 11700.00*

94 111-142-002-000 10800.00*

95 111-142-003-000 22,900.00                             

96 111-152-013-000 NO BID

97 111-161-014-000 7,000.00                                

98 111-161-049-000 4,900.00                                

99 111-241-030-000 7300.00*

100 201-112-005-000 40,300.00                             

101 201-252-001-000 REDEEMED

102 203-051-044-000 18,200.00                             

103 203-092-053-000 NO BID

104 203-383-019-000 REDEEMED

105 214-021-005-000 REDEEMED

106 216-261-057-000 WITHDRAWN

107 217-251-003-000 WITHDRAWN

108 300-041-014-000 REDEEMED

109 314-141-013-000 REDEEMED

110 509-162-023-000 30,100.00                             

111 510-081-024-000 WITHDRAWN

112 510-231-029-000 WITHDRAWN

113 511-182-006-000 REDEEMED

114 515-331-033-000 REDEEMED

115 522-291-026-000 REDEEMED

116 525-261-007-000 REDEEMED

117 525-281-012-000 REDEEMED

*These properties were re-offered and sold through 

Bid4Assets on June 9th, 2015


